
October 19, 1983: The End of N.J.M.: The
Grenada Chronicles
On October 19, 1983, the United States invaded the Caribbean island of
Grenada. The invasion, codenamed Operation Urgent Fury, was launched
in response to a request from the Governor-General of Grenada, Sir Paul
Scoon, who claimed that the island's Marxist government was on the verge
of collapse.
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The invasion was met with widespread international condemnation, and it
remains a controversial topic today. Some argue that the invasion was
justified, while others believe that it was an act of aggression that violated
international law.

The Grenada Chronicles is a comprehensive account of the invasion and
its aftermath. The book is based on interviews with key participants in the
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invasion, including American soldiers, Grenadian civilians, and members of
the Marxist government. The book also includes a wealth of archival
research.

The Grenada Chronicles is a valuable resource for anyone who wants to
learn more about this important event in history. The book provides a
balanced and objective account of the invasion, and it offers a unique
perspective on the role of the United States in the Caribbean.

The Invasion

The invasion of Grenada began on October 19, 1983, with a pre-dawn
airstrike on the island's main airport. American troops then landed on the
island and quickly overwhelmed the Grenadian military. The invasion was
completed within a few days, and the Marxist government was overthrown.

The invasion was justified by the Reagan administration on the grounds
that the Marxist government was a threat to American security. However,
many critics argued that the invasion was actually motivated by the Reagan
administration's desire to overthrow a leftist government in the Caribbean.

The Aftermath

The invasion of Grenada had a number of lasting consequences. The
Marxist government was overthrown, and a pro-American government was
installed in its place. The invasion also led to a deterioration in relations
between the United States and Cuba, which had provided military support
to the Marxist government.

The invasion of Grenada remains a controversial topic today. Some argue
that the invasion was justified, while others believe that it was an act of



aggression that violated international law. The Grenada Chronicles
provides a valuable resource for anyone who wants to learn more about
this important event in history.

The Grenada Chronicles is a comprehensive and objective account of the
invasion of Grenada and its aftermath. The book is based on interviews
with key participants in the invasion, including American soldiers,
Grenadian civilians, and members of the Marxist government. The book
also includes a wealth of archival research.

The Grenada Chronicles is a valuable resource for anyone who wants to
learn more about this important event in history. The book provides a
balanced and objective account of the invasion, and it offers a unique
perspective on the role of the United States in the Caribbean.
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